INFORMATION HANDOUT

For Contract No. 10-1C9304
At 10-Ama-124-R2.5/R10.3

Identified by
Project ID 1014000206

MATERIALS INFORMATION

Water Source Information



Lian, Joe@DOT

From: De Claro, Rhodel B@DOT

Sent: Monday, December 15, 2014 10:35 AM
To: Lian, Joe@DOT

Subject: RE: Water Source for EA 10-1C9301
Attachments: RE: 10-1C900 Water Agency Question
Joe,

Please see attached email correspondence.

1. Company name: Amador Water Agency

2. Cost: $900 deposit (530 non-refundable), $30/month plus $2.50/unit (or 748 gal).

3. Address (taken from google search): 12800 Ridge Road, Sutter Creek, CA 95685

4. Contact info/person: (209) 223-3018, Carol Balowski (cbalowski@amadorwater.org)
Thank you,

Rhodel De Claro, PE
Caltrans District 10
Maintenance Design
(209)942-6048

From: Lian, Joe@DOT

Sent: Monday, December 15, 2014 10:26 AM
To: De Claro, Rhodel B@DOT

Subject: Water Source for EA 10-1C9301

Hi Rhodel,

Can you provide me some kind of document that describe the water source? Such as name of the company, rate charge,
address, phone number and contact person?

Joe Lian
Dist 06 OE
(559) 243-8005



Lian, Joe@DOT

From: Carol Balowski [chalowski@amadorwater.org]
Sent: Thursday, October 30, 2014 11:09 AM

To: De Claro, Rhodel B@DOT

Subject: RE: 10-1C900 Water Agency Question

I’'m afraid | don’t have the list yet. We have been directing others to go to Castle Oaks entrance or on Shakeley Lane near
the shopping center, but that may all change. | should be getting the revised list very soon.

From: De Claro, Rhodel B@DOT [mailto:Rhodel.De.Claro@dot.ca.gov]
Sent: Thursday, October 30, 2014 6:31 AM

To: Carol Balowski

Subject: RE: 10-1C900 Water Agency Question

Carol,
Thank you for the information, and if you could, please provide the list of hydrant locations. | can accept the list as-is at
this point as it is not critical to have an accurate, current list. Thanks again and have a great day.

Thank you,

Rhodel De Claro, PE
Caltrans District 10
Maintenance Design
(209)942-6048

From: Carol Balowski [mailto:cbalowski@amadorwater.org]
Sent: Wednesday, October 29, 2014 3:53 PM

To: De Claro, Rhodel B@DOT

Subject: RE: 10-1C900 Water Agency Question

Our company name is Amador Water Agency. The charge for the meter is $900.00 deposit with a $30.00 nonrefundable
administrative fee. We hold $870.00 on the account as the deposit. This can be applied to a closing bill or if account is
paid in full, it will be refunded once the meter is returned. The meter size is a 3-inch and the fitting on the meter and
hydrant is 2-1/2”. The water in lone would be potable water. Also, the service charge per month (whether water is used
or not for that month) is $30.00 and $2.50 per unit or per 748 gallons. They are currently updating a list on the hydrants
that can be used for pulling water and | can get that to you at a later date as the list is not quite completed.

From: De Claro, Rhodel B@DOT [mailto:Rhodel.De.Claro@dot.ca.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, October 29, 2014 3:44 PM

To: Carol Balowski

Subject: 10-1C900 Water Agency Question

Hi Carol,

First, thank you for helping me out over the phone. As per our conversation, please provide the following information:
1. Name of local water agency (Amador Water Agency?)
2. Meter size of the hydrant, and the charge per meter.
3. Isnon-potable water available in the area?

Thank you,



Rhodel De Claro, PE
Caltrans District 10
Maintenance Design
(209)942-6048

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail and any attachments are for the sole use of the addressee(s) and may be privileged, confidential and protected from
disclosure. If you have received this message in error or are not the intended recipient, then we (1) advise you that any disclosure, copying, distribution, saving or
use of this information is strictly prohibited, and (2) request that you delete this e-mail and any attachments and notify us by reply e-mail or telephone 209-223-
3018.

Thank You,

Amador Water Agency 12800 Ridge Road, Sutter Creek, California 95685 www.amadorwater.org

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail and any attachments are for the sole use of the addressee(s) and may be privileged, confidential and protected from
disclosure. If you have received this message in error or are not the intended recipient, then we (1) advise you that any disclosure, copying, distribution, saving or
use of this information is strictly prohibited, and (2) request that you delete this e-mail and any attachments and notify us by reply e-mail or telephone 209-223-
3018.

Thank You,

Amador Water Agency 12800 Ridge Road, Sutter Creek, California 95685 www.amadorwater.org



